
Give to AgEcon Search

The World’s Largest Open Access Agricultural & Applied Economics Digital Library

This document is discoverable and free to researchers across the 
globe due to the work of AgEcon Search.

Help ensure our sustainability.

AgEcon Search
http://ageconsearch.umn.edu

aesearch@umn.edu

Papers downloaded from AgEcon Search may be used for non-commercial purposes and personal study only. 
No other use, including posting to another Internet site, is permitted without permission from the copyright 
owner (not AgEcon Search), or as allowed under the provisions of Fair Use, U.S. Copyright Act, Title 17 U.S.C.

No endorsement of AgEcon Search or its fundraising activities by the author(s) of the following work or their 
employer(s) is intended or implied.

https://shorturl.at/nIvhR
mailto:aesearch@umn.edu
http://ageconsearch.umn.edu/


 

Relation between financial leverage and firm performance: Evidence from Jordan   |   BEH: www.beh.pradec.eu 

- 626 -                © 2018 Prague Development Center 

Peer-reviewed and  Open access journal 

ISSN: 1804-5006 | www.academicpublishingplatforms.com 

BEH - Business and Economic Horizons 

Volume 14 | Issue 3 | 2018 |pp.626-641 

The primary version of the journal is the on-line version DOI: http://dx.doi.org/10.15208/beh.2018.44 

Moderating effect of competitive strategies on 
the relation between financial leverage and firm 

performance: Evidence from Jordan 

Mahmoud Al-Rdaydeh,1 Ammar Yaser Almansour,2 Mohammad Ahmad Al-Omari2                                                                                                                                                         

1Faculty of Economic and Business, Jadara University, Jordan                                                                 
2Faculty of Business, Amman Arab University, Jordan 

corresponding e-mail: mahmouda27[at]gmail(dot)com                                                                                                                 

address: Department of Banking and Finance, Faculty of Economic and Business, Jadara University,                                                  

Irbid, P.O. Box 733, Postal Code 21110, Jordan 

Abstract: This study examined the moderating role of competitive strategy in the relationship between 

financial leverage and performance of firms based on a sample of industrial firms in Jordan between 2007 

and 2016. The interaction between competitive strategy and financial leverage was revealed to influence the 

effects of financial leverage towards the performance of firms in terms of return on assets (accounting-based 

measure) and market-to-book ratio (market-based measure). Conclusively, obtained results are in line with 

the notion that firms that employ cost leadership strategy experience tax advantages and increased 

efficiency through debt financing and/or debt covenants. This study extends the overall understanding on 

the effects of financial leverage towards performance of firms and how this relationship is moderated by 

competitive strategy among firms in an emerging market such as Jordan. 

JEL Classifications: D21, G32 

Keywords: Financial leverage, firm performance, competitive strategies, industrial firms, Jordan 

Citation: Al-Rdaydeh, M., Almansour, A. Y., & Al-Omari, M. A. (2018). Moderating effect of competitive 

strategies on the relation between financial leverage and firm performance: Evidence from Jordan. Business 

and Economic Horizons, 14(3), 626-641. http://dx.doi.org/10.15208/beh.2018.44 

1. Introduction  

Under the assumptions of perfect capital markets, Modigliani and Miller (1958) 
propounded the notion that the firm value is not determined by its capital structure or 
securities issues, but by its real assets. These assumptions of perfect capital markets are 
rather restrictive and unrealistic in nature, which create ambiguity to the theory of capital 
structure itself. Its inconclusiveness in the context of corporate finance has propelled 
numerous studies to examine the underlying assumptions of how the capital structure 
influences the firms’ performance and further rationalize this proposition. In particular, 
one of the key studies that demonstrated the relationship between capital structure and 
performance of firms is the study performed by Jensen and Meckling (1976), which 
revealed that financial leverage owned by firms (in their capital structure) influences the 
behavior and operating decisions of managers, whether to perform in the interest of 
shareholders (Brav, Graham, Harvey, & Michaely, 2005; Graham & Harvey, 2001; Harris 
& Raviv, 1991). Following that, studies on the effects of financial leverage towards the 
performance of firms have been extensively conducted over the past decades, but the 
empirical evidences presented revealed inconsistency and the relationship remains 
inconclusive. 
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Certain studies concluded that the performance of firms is positively related to the 
financial leverage (Ghosh, Nag, & Sirmans, 2000; Hadlock & James, 2002; Roden & 
Lewellen, 1995; Taub, 1975) whereas Gleason, Mathur, and Mathur (2000), Fama and 
French (1998), and Simerly and Li (2000) concluded that financial leverage negatively 
influences firms’ performance. These inconsistencies may also be due to the approaches 
applied in these studies, which mostly focused only on how financial leverage of firms 
directly influences their performance (e.g., Barton & Gordon, 1987; O'brien, 2003; 
Robinson & Phillips McDougall, 2001) when this relationship may depend on the 
competitive strategy adopted by these firms (O’Brien, 2003). Moreover, it is not unusual 
that firms apply different strategies to gain competitive advantage, particularly in a highly 
competitive environment. Adding to that, competition itself may be a salient factor that 
drives these firms to acquire debts in order to finance their businesses. 

In the context of strategic management, Porter (1985) recommended two types of 
competitive strategy to gain competitive advantage for superior performance, which are 
(1) cost leadership strategy and (2) product differentiation strategy. The increasing usage 
of debt due to the increasing cost of debt compels higher performance among managers 
in their financial obligations (Berger & Di Patti, 2006). Accordingly, managers are 
prompted to efficiently utilize the provided financial resources according to the 
established debt agreements to pay creditors on time (Simerly & Li, 2000). This scenario is 
known as the critical agency problem-controlling mechanism. Accordingly, competitive 
strategy significantly influences the effectiveness of this mechanism (Jermias, 2008), which 
potentially affect the usage of debt. Firms achieve operational efficiency for cost reduction 
in the context of cost leadership. Thus, operational efficiency is deemed critical in cost 
leadership. Creditors impose debt agreements, which prompt managers to employ 
efficient utilization of financial resources for higher performance. Meanwhile, in the 
context of product differentiation, firms set themselves apart from competitors through 
the creation of products and services, which emphasizes creativity and innovation. As the 
decisions made by such firms typically involve risk, firms have to make use of the debt to 
achieve higher performance without affecting their creativity and innovation.  

Meanwhile, the recent free trade agreements between Jordan and countries such as 
Canada, Europe, and the United States spur intense competition among firms (Al-Rfou, 
2012; Hutaibat, 2005), which prompt these firms to employ competitive strategies. 
Therefore, the need to examine the moderating role of competitive strategy in the 
relationship between financial leverage and performance of firms is significantly pivotal, 
particularly among the listed industrial firms in Jordan, which was addressed in this study.  

This paper is organized as follows: Section 2 presents an overview of the related literature 
and the hypotheses of this study; Section 3 provides description of the methodology 
adopted in this study; Section 4 reports the details of data analyses as well as the obtained 
results; Section 5 concludes the major findings, limitations, and implications of this study. 

2. Literature review 

There are numerous studies on the effects of financial leverage towards firms’ 
performance, but the concept of debt remains inconclusive for firms. Certain studies (e.g., 
Balakrishnan & Fox, 1993; Gleason et al., 2000) provided empirical evidences that 
leverage negatively influences performance of firms. In particular, Jensen & Meckling 
(1976) revealed the relationship between agency costs (such as monitoring and bonding 
costs) and debt financing for the sake of protecting the firms’ interest. On the other hand, 
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Myers (1977) asserted that part of the investment go to the debt holders in debt financing, 
which prompts equity holders to under-invest, leading to firms’ subpar performance. 
Similarly, Simerly & Li (2000) argued that higher debt empowers the debt holders over 
these firms through debt covenants, which narrows the options available for the managers 
and eventually causes ineffective firm management. Debt holders’ propensity to put 
emphasis on intermediate objectives, which primarily focus on acquiring specified 
principal payments and interest as agreed in the contract, may affect the long-term survival 
of firms negatively (Jensen, 1986). In addition, the increase in debt financing reduces 
managers’ willingness to take on projects with high risk even when they are profitable 
(Balakrishnan & Fox, 1993). 

On the contrary, there are also other empirical studies that opposed to the 
aforementioned claims, which revealed that financial leverage positively influences 
performance of firms (e.g., Ghosh et al., 2000; Spence, 1985). Jensen (1986) postulated 
that debt covenants ensure that the financial obligations of managers are performed 
responsibly and the discretionary expenditure is reduced to settle the debts. Failure to 
settle these debts leads to financial problems and in more critical cases, bankruptcy, which 
put the managers’ position at risk (Jensen, 1989). Lubatkin & Chatterjee (1994) note that 
interest is tax deductible in arguing that debt will improve firm performance because a 
portion of the cost of capital is passed from the stockholders to the government  . Harris 
& Raviv (1991) argued that higher debts drive the common interest of managers and 
shareholders. These authors propose that by increasing debts, a firm intensifies the 
influence of its lenders, who can constrain managers’ ability to make decisions which the 
lenders believe would negatively impact the firm. The bonding agreement between a firm 
and its lenders might discipline managers to run the firm more efficiently (Jensen, 1986).    

Basically, there are no consistent evidences to establish the effects of financial leverage 
towards firms’ performance (Harris & Raviv, 1991) given the results obtained varied and 
contradicted each other. Therefore, certain studies (e.g., Barton & Gordon, 1988; O'brien, 
2003) recommended that studies on the effects of financial leverage towards the 
performance of firms should consider hypothetically plausible variables through 
integrative approach. Addressing that, this study examined the moderating role of 
competitive strategy in the relationship between financial leverage and performance. 

Firms employ competitive strategy to gain competitive advantage, which potentially affect 
their debt borrowing. Porter (1985), who broadly categorized competitive strategy into 
cost leadership and product differentiation, proposed a framework on how firms decide 
on the type of strategy to effectively compete; either by producing at the lowest cost in 
industry (cost leadership strategy) or by delivering unique product or service (product 
differentiation strategy). This conceptually valid classification is widely recognized and has 
been extensively adopted in various studies (e.g., David, 2011; Hambrick, 1983; A. Miller, 
1998). 

The agency theory of capital expounded the effects of such strategies towards the firms’ 
decision on debt borrowing (Jensen & Meckling, 1976). Based on this theory, managers 
are supposedly function independently and able to make use of the shareholders’ stakes 
for their own benefits. For instance, instead of projecting free cash flows into positive 
projects, managers use these available resources as bonuses for their own stakes (Jensen, 
1986). Thus, debt borrowing is introduced for application in order to ensure managers 
serve the best interest for stakeholders (Jensen & Meckling, 1976; Jensen, 1986). 
Therefore, high debt increases the cost of debt, which contributes to higher performance 
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among managers in fulfilling their financial obligations (Berger & Di Patti, 2006). 
Meanwhile, debt covenants drive managers to practice efficient utilization of resources in 
ensuring timely repayment (Simerly & Li, 2000). As previously discussed, this is known as 
critical agency problem-controlling mechanism, which is highly contingent on competitive 
strategy (cost leadership or product differentiation) (Jermias, 2008). 

Expectedly, firms with cost leadership strategy aim to produce at the lowest cost in the 
industry. In order to achieve that, there are different aspects to be considered, such as 
advertising, cost controls, cost reduction in research and development, efficient scale 
facilities, overhead controls, and sales force. Firms with this strategy typically gain above-
average profits despite the lowering of their costs (D. Miller & Friesen, 1986). Thus, 
operational efficiency is considered integral for firms that employ this type of strategy. In 
addition, the usage of debt benefits these firms through the increase in managerial 
efficiency with the monitoring of lenders (Jordan et al., 1998) towards enhanced 
performance. The monitoring of lenders ensures that managers perform their financial 
obligations responsibly without discretionary spending (Jensen, 1986). Thus, Jensen (1986) 
suggested that the control function of debt is significant for firms that endeavor to be 
efficient.   In short, debt covenants propel managers to practice effective utilization of 
financial resources towards better performance given the significance of operational 
efficiency in cost leadership strategy.  

Meanwhile, firms with product differentiation strategy aim to set themselves apart from 
competitors by providing products or services of unique quality, specifically in terms of 
branding, customer service, design, special features, and technology. Typically, firms with 
this type of strategy primarily focus on unique needs that require high creativity and 
innovation capabilities, rather than acquiring maximum market share, which drive firms’ 
propensity to invest heavily in research and development activities to remain competitive 
(Miller, 1987). In order to achieve sustainable competitive advantage, these firms require 
not just unique competencies, but also substantial financial resources (Postma & Zwart, 
2001), which push these firms to borrow from creditors. However, debt covenants with 
increased debt as well as requirements are likely to limit managers’ creativity and 
innovation for competitive advantage (Balakrishnan & Fox, 1993; Li & Simerly, 2002). 
Adding to that, these firms also encounter high uncertainty because they deal with risky 
decisions on products or services that are yet to be realized (Jermias, 2008). The imposed 
covenants by creditors can affect creativity and innovation activities by avoiding the risky 
decisions of managers, thus leading to the effective use of debt and achieving a better 
performance.    

There are several empirical evidences on the moderating role of competitive strategy in 
influencing the effects of financial leverage towards the performance of firms. In 
particular, both competitive strategy and financial leverage were revealed to influence the 
performance of firms significantly (O’Brien, 2003; Barton & Gordon, 1988), which 
demonstrates the possibility of the type of strategy adopted by firms in influencing the 
effects of financial leverage towards the performance of firms. Meanwhile, Jermias (2008) 
and Farooq, Ashraf, & Ahmad (2014) corroborated that competitive strategy did function 
as a moderator in this particular relationship and further revealed that, between the two 
types of competitive strategy, product differentiation strategy put firms at higher 
disadvantage. Consistent results on cost leadership strategy reaffirmed that firms 
experience tax advantages as well as improved efficiency through debt financing (as a 
result of constraints imposed by debt holders that propel improved performance).  
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Nonetheless, the effects of financial leverage towards firms’ performance in the context of 
the current study remain ambiguous with inconsistent results: negative relationship 
(Ramadan & Ramadan, 2015; Zeitun & Tian, 2007), positive relationship (Al-Taani, 2013; 
Almajali, Alamro, & Al-Soub, 2012), as well as insignificant relationship (which 
determined that the capital structure is not significant factor to the performance of firms) 
(Almajali et al., 2012). Moreover, Hutaibat (2005) and Al-Rfou (2012) reaffirmed firms in 
Jordan employ diverse business strategies to remain competitive due to the intense 
competition, which is resulted from the new free agreements with countries such as 
Canada, Europe, and the United States. Therefore, this study examined the moderating 
effects of competitive strategy on the effects of financial leverage towards firms’ 
performance in developing countries, particularly Jordan. With that, this study proposed 
the following hypotheses:  

H1: The negative effects of financial leverage towards return on assets are more 
significant for firms with product differentiation strategy compared to firms with cost 
leadership strategy.  

H2: The negative effects of financial leverage towards market-to-book value are more 
significant for firms with product differentiation strategy compared to firms with cost 
leadership strategy.  

3. Research methodology 

3.1. Research design  

This study employed panel data regression and sampled listed industrial firms between 
2007 and 2016 in Amman Stock Exchange (ASE), which is one of the most extensive 
stock exchanges in the region of Middle East.  

TABLE 1. FIRMS LISTED AT ASE BY THE END OF 2016 SELECTED FOR THE STUDY 

SUB-SECTOR TITLES 

 

LISTED FIRMS                               

IN EACH SECTOR 
THE SELECTED FIRMS                       

FOR THE STUDY 

Pharmaceutical and medical industries 7 6 

Chemical industries 8 8 

Paper and cardboard industries 2 2 

Printing and packaging 1 1 

Food and beverages 11 8 

Mining and extraction industries 16 15 

Engineering and construction 9 9 

Electrical industries 4 4 

Tobacco and cigarettes 2 2 

Textiles, leathers and clothing 7 6 

Glass and ceramic industries 1 0 

Total 68 61 

 

The effects of financial leverage towards performance of firms in Jordan as well as the 
moderating role of competitive strategy were specifically examined in this study. Law No. 
12 (1964) was the first Company Law in Jordan with its first administration enacted in 
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1966. As one of the emerging economies, Jordan is strategically located with access to 
large consumer market, which put it as one of the most important locations in the region 
of Middle East. However, the non-financial sector in Jordan encounter poor performance 
in the recent years (Alabdullah, Yahya, & Ramayah, 2014). Only industrial sector was 
considered for this study because industrial firms tend to adopt diverse competitive 
strategies and sample of single sector would reduce heterogeneity issue (Ginsberg & 
Venkatraman, 1985; Moores & Yuen, 2001). As shown in Table 1, this study sampled 61 
industrial firms from 10 different sub-sectors in ASE with the exclusion of financial firms, 
service firms, and other firms with incomplete data. 

3.2. Measurement of variables 

The performance of industrial firms was considered as the dependent variable in this 
study. More specifically, the performance of industrial firms is typically assessed based on 
(1) accounting-based measure, which considers financial statements of firms, such as 
return on assets (ROA), return on equity (ROE), and return on investment (ROI) (e.g., 
Abor, 2005; Majumdar & Chhibber, 1999) and (2) market-based measure, which includes 
stock returns and volatility (Welch, 2004). Therefore, this study considered ROA (for 
accounting-based measure) and market-to-book ratio (for market-based measure) to 
evaluate the performance of firms including their stock market activity as well as any other 
potential factors that may influence the performance of firms, which is in line with (Salim 
& Yadav, 2012; Zeitun & Tian, 2007). With that, these measures were determined based 
on the following equations: 

𝑅𝑂𝐴(𝑖,𝑡) = 𝑁𝐼(𝑖,𝑡)/𝑇𝐴(𝑖,𝑡) (1) 

Where, ROA denotes return on assets, NI denotes net income, TA denotes total assets, i 
represents firm, and t represents year. Specifically, ROA indicates the profitability of a 
firm in relative to its total assets, which provides manager, investor, or analyst significant 
insights on the efficiency of the firm’s asset management in generating earnings.  

𝑀𝐵𝑉(𝑖,𝑡) = 𝑀𝐶(𝑖,𝑡)/𝐵𝑉𝐴(𝑖,𝑡)       (2) 

Where, MBV signifies market-to-book value, MC signifies market capitalization of a firm, 
BVA signifies book value of assets, i represents firm, and t represents year. With this 
proxy of performance, future expectations of performance of these firms are incorporated 
as well, which is considered as one of its main strengths (O’Brien, 2003).  

This study considered financial leverage as the independent variable, which is calculated 
based on the ratio of total liabilities to total assets. This calculation was extensively 
adopted in studies on capital structure (Huizinga, Laeven, & Nicodeme, 2008; Matar & 
Eneizan, 2018; Rajan & Zingales, 1995). Financial leverage offers two main benefits: (1) 
trade credit is recognized as short-term financing source and (2) financial leverage is 
available for all firms. In particular, the study measured the degree of financial leverage for 
a firm to finance business activities based on the following equation: 
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𝐹𝐿𝐸𝑉(𝑖,𝑡) = 𝑇𝐿(𝑖,𝑡)/𝑇𝐴(𝑖,𝑡)       (3) 

Where, FLEV indicates financial leverage, TL indicates total liabilities of a firm, TA 
indicates total assets of a firm, i represents firm, and t represents year.  

This study included three control variables, namely, (1) firm size, (2) growth opportunities 
of firm, and (3) dividend policy of firm. Firstly, firm size essentially represents the 
financing patterns of a firm. Small firms tend to employ informal financing and lower 

external financing compared to large firms (Beck, Demirguc‐Kunt, Laeven, & Levine, 
2008). The natural logarithms of the total asset are taking as a measurement for this 
variable to reduce the influence of outliers in the regression analysis. Secondly, high 
growth opportunities of firms reflect high performance ratio based on the notion that 
investments generate profits (Zeitun & Tian, 2007). Expectedly, growth opportunities 
positively influence the performance of firms. This variable is measured by talking the log-
differences of the firm’s sales. Finally, dividend policy of firms is calculated as the yearly 
dividend per share over the earnings per share. Compared to firm with low dividend 
payout, firm with high dividend payout is more likely to have higher market value with 
lower book value of assets (Jermias, 2008). 

Apart from that, this study conceptualized competitive strategy as the moderator in the 
relationship between financial leverage and performance of firms. In this context, 
competitive strategy comprised of cost leadership strategy and product differentiation 
strategy, which generally reflect the strategic orientation of firms. Similar to previous 
studies (e.g., Chen & Jermias, 2014; O'brien, 2003; Robinson & Phillips McDougall, 2001), 
this study categorized firms based on the framework proposed by Porter (1985). Besides 
its internal consistency, this classification proves to be academically accepted as well 
(Hambrick, 1983; Dess & Davis, 1984).  

Similar to other studies (e.g., Chen & Jermias, 2014; Farooq et al., 2014; Singh & Agarwal, 
2002), this study objectively classified firms using cluster analysis based on the types of 
competitive strategy, which are cost leadership and product differentiation. Besides that, 
this study used three classifying variables: (1) inventory turnover, (2) asset utilization 
efficiency, and (3) premium price capability (Farooq et al., 2014; Gani & Jermias, 2006; 
Jermias, 2008), which were measured based on the following equations (4, 5): 

𝐼𝑉𝑇(𝑖,𝑡) = 𝑆𝐴(𝑖,𝑡)/𝐼𝑁𝑉(𝑖,𝑡)       (4) 

Where, IVT signifies inventory turnover, SA signifies sales of a firm, INV signifies 
inventory of a firm, i represents firm, and t represents year. Inventory turnover represents 
the significance of cost leadership to firm. In order to gain higher profit, firms employ 
cost leadership strategy through economy of scale (Farooq et al., 2014), which reduce their 
inventory turnover in days. Meanwhile, firms that employ product differentiation strategy 
do not rely on the economy of scale, but through high prices. As a result, these firms have 
higher inventory turnover in days.  
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𝐴𝑈𝐸(𝑖,𝑡) = 𝑆𝐴(𝑖,𝑡)/𝑇𝐴(𝑖,𝑡)       (5) 

Where, AUE denotes asset utilization efficiency, SA denotes sales of a firm, TA denotes 
the total assets of firm, i represents firm, and t represents year. The significance of cost 
leadership strategy for firms is associated to AUE, where firms produce at the lowest cost 
in the industry through cost minimization, economy of scale, overhead cost control, and 
tight cost control in achieving higher efficiency in their operations, such as in the areas of 
advertising, research and development, sales force, and services (Porter, 1980). Therefore, 
firms with cost leadership strategy achieve higher ratio of asset utilization efficiency 
compared to firms with product differentiation strategy.  

𝑃𝑃𝐶(𝑖,𝑡) = 𝐺𝑀(𝑖,𝑡)/𝑆𝐴(𝑖,𝑡)       (6) 

Where, PPC represents premium price capability, GM is gross margin of firm, SA denotes 
sales of a firm, i represents firm, and t represents year. Premium price capability of a firm 
reveals the ability of a firm to charge premium prices. Expectedly, compared to firms with 
cost leadership strategy, firms with product differentiation strategy deliver innovative 
products and services with higher capability for premium price. 

Using cluster analysis, inventory turnover, asset utilization efficiency, and premium price 
capability differentiate the type of competitive strategy in firms, which revealed that firms 
with product differentiation strategy, compared to firms with cost leadership strategy, 
have higher inventory turnover in days, lower operational efficiency, and higher gross 
profit margin (Farooq et al., 2014; Gani & Jermias, 2006; Jermias, 2008). 

3.3. Data analysis technique and empirical models 

This study employed panel data regression to examine the relationship between financial 
leverage and performance of firms. Panel data regression primarily depends on an 
observation set of individual variables over different time points (Hsiao, 1986; Yaffee, 
2003), which is a widely adopted method. Compared to time series analysis or cross 
section analysis, panel data analysis is capable to eliminate unobservable heterogeneity for 
every observation in the sample, reduce multicollinearity among variables, include higher 
degrees of freedom, and reduce bias (Baltagi, 2005). 

With respect to the objective of this study, this study presented mathematical explanations 
for the following models. This study applied multiple regression technique for the full 
sample based on the following equation: 

𝑅𝑂𝐴𝑖𝑡 = 𝛼 + 𝛽1𝐹𝐿𝐸𝑉𝑖𝑡 + 𝛽2𝑆𝑇𝑅𝑖𝑡 + 𝛽3(𝐹𝐿𝐸𝑉 ∗ 𝑆𝑇𝑅)𝑖𝑡 + 𝛽4𝑆𝐼𝑍𝐸𝑖𝑡
+ 𝛽5𝐺𝑂𝑃𝑖𝑡 + 𝛽6𝐷𝑃𝑃𝑖𝑡 + ԑ𝑖𝑡 

(7) 
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𝑀𝐵𝑉𝑖𝑡 = 𝛼 + 𝛽1𝐹𝐿𝐸𝑉𝑖𝑡 + 𝛽2𝑆𝑇𝑅𝑖𝑡 + 𝛽3(𝐹𝐿𝐸𝑉 ∗ 𝑆𝑇𝑅)𝑖𝑡 + 𝛽4𝑆𝐼𝑍𝐸𝑖𝑡
+ 𝛽5𝐺𝑂𝑃𝑖𝑡 + 𝛽6𝐷𝑃𝑃𝑖𝑡 + ԑ𝑖𝑡 

(8) 

Where, ROA denote return on assets, MBV represent market to book value of assets, 
FLEV refers to the financial leverage, SIZE is the firm size, GOP refers to the firm’s 
growth opportunities and DPP represent the firm’s dividend payout policy. 

4. Empirical results 

4.1. Cluster analysis 

Prior to regression analysis (to analyze the moderating effects of competitive strategy), 
selected firms were classified into (1) cost leadership and (2) product differentiation using 
cluster analysis, which was similarly adopted by Singh and Agarwal (2002). More 
specifically, three significant classifying variables (IVT, AUE, and PPC) were used to 
classify these firms into two clusters. Firms that employ product differentiation strategy 
reveal high IVT in days, low AUE, and high PPC. On the contrary, firms that employ cost 
leadership strategy demonstrate low IVT in days, high AUE, and low PPC. 

Referring to Table 2, the results of cluster analysis revealed two clusters with distinct 
characteristics pertaining to the classifying variables (inventory turnover, asset utilization 
efficiency, and premium price capability). With a total sample of 596 observations, 48 
observations (8%) were recorded in Cluster 1 whereas 548 observations (90%) were 
recorded in Cluster 2. Meanwhile, 14 observations (2%) were of missing data. With 
respect to the classifying variables, firms with cost leadership strategy were classified in 
Cluster 2 whereas Cluster 1 represented firms with product differentiation strategy.  

TABLE 2. RESULTS OF CLUSTER ANALYSIS 

Variables / Cluster Cluster 1 Cluster 2 

AUE 0.036 times 0.625 times 

PPC 1.779 times 0.279 times 

IVT 3417.1 days 169.2 days 

Number of Cases in Each Cluster 48 (8%) 548 (90%) 
 

4.2. Descriptive statistics  

Mean, minimum and maximum values, and standard deviation of continuous variables as 
well as explanatory variables in this study are presented in Table 3. As known, the 
performance of firms (dependent variable) in this study was measured by two proxies, 
which were (1) return on assets (ROA) and (2) market-to-book value (MBV). As shown in 
the table, the variable of MBV has recorded an average 1.11, and varying from (-3.1) to 
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3.5. While the other proxy for firm performance which is, ROA has recorded, a lower 
average compares to MBV approximately equal to 0.21%, with maximum is 43%.  

This study focused on the effects of financial leverage (FLEV) towards the performance 
of firms, with competitive strategy as the moderator. FLEV was measured based on the 
ratio of total liabilities to total assets, which recorded mean ratio of approximately 36%, 
with a range between 0.39% and 227%. The percentage indicated certain firms depended 
on leverage during certain period, up to the point of 227% of their total assets. In other 
words, this implies that these firms significantly depended on external finance as their 
main financing source for their operations, which is consistent with the results presented 
by Ayyagari, Demirgüç-Kunt, and Maksimovic (2012) in their study on firms in 
developing countries.  

The relationship between moderator and independent variable of this study revealed an 
average of approximately 36%. The final three variables presented in Table 3 were the 
control variables of this study. In particular, the natural logarithm of total assets measured 
the firm size (SIZE), which revealed mean ratio of 7.27 with a range between 5.5 and 9.1. 
Meanwhile, the log-difference of total sales measured the growth opportunities (GOP), 
which recorded mean ratio of 0.82% with a range between -1.9 and 7.72. Last but not 
least, the final control variable was dividend policy of firms, which ranged between (-
160)% and 671%, with an average of 48.8%.  

TABLE 3. THE DESCRIPTIVE STATISTICS FOR ALL VARIABLES 

VARIABLES OBSERVATIONS MEAN STD. DEV. MINIMUM MAXIMUM 

ROA 600 0.0021 0.1347 -1.9529 0.4329 

MBV 586 1.1171 0.6983 -3.1183 3.5343 

FLEV 600 0.3624 0.2591 0.0039 2.2752 

STR 596 0.8947 0.3071 0 1 

FLEV*STR 600 0.0072 0.0801 -0.3447 0.3242 

SIZE 600 7.2787 0.5801 5.5963 9.0875 

GOP 553 0.0082 0.4635 -1.9159 7.7202 

DPP 600 0.4886 2.8365 -1.6034 67.1621 

 

4.3. Regression analysis  

This study applied fixed and random effects regression models based on the results of 
Hausman test and Breusch–Pagan LM test. In addition, this study performed several 
diagnostic tests, such as autocorrelation test, heteroscedasticity test, multicollinearity test, 
and panel unit root test, to examine the robustness of observations, specifically to validate 
the reliability of regression models as well as whether they are free from econometric 
issues. Obtained results revealed that the data were free from stationary issue, but 
multicollinearity issues for the moderator considered in this study were present. However, 
this is not surprising because multicollinearity issues typically present in studies on 
interaction effect or moderation because models with the presence of either of these have 
high correlation with independent variables. In particular, the interaction term (e.g., x*z) is 
typically associated to the components of x and z (Aguinis, 2004). Addressing these, 
mean-centered approach and standardized approach are typically adopted as solutions. 
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Numerical instability is closely linked to multicollinearity issues, which can be addressed 
through mean-centered approach (Afshartous & Preston, 2011). This approach 
significantly reduces the multicollinearity issue because the correlation between the 
interaction term of the deviations from the mean-transformed variables and these 
deviations from the mean decreases by a large degree (Cronbach, 1987). Thus, this study 
considered this particular approach in addressing the multicollinearity issue. The obtained 
results for all models are presented in Table 4, which revealed no correlation among the 
independent variables with VIF results varied between 1.01 and 1.60. In other words, 
there was no multicollinearity issue among the independent variables for models presented 
in this study. Additionally, the obtained results of diagnostic tests implied that the data of 
this study had autocorrelation and heteroscedasticity issues, which led to the application of 
fixed and random robust standard errors methods in addressing these violations of 
assumptions.  

TABLE 4. THE REGRESSION RESULTS 

VARIABLES MODEL (1) 
ROA 

 MODEL (2) 
MBV 

COEFFICIENT T-STATISTIC VIF  COEFFICIENT T-STATISTIC VIF 

FLEV -0.3455 -6.88*** 1.60  -0.3799 -1.44* 1.56 

STR -0.0248 -1.22 1.34  0.1045 0.76 1.34 

FLEVSTR 0.2125 2.21** 1.33  -2.1436 -2.92*** 1.29 

SIZE 0.1427 2.36** 1.03  0.1056 0.92 1.03 

GOP -0.0062 -0.52 1.03  0.1726 1.58 1.03 

DPP 0.0007 1.10 1.01  -0.0008 -0.45 1.01 

INTERCEPT -0.8885 -2.05**   0.3676 0.43  

R2 0.35  0.15 

F-STATISTIC 0.00  0.03 
Notes: Significant level *** 1%, ** 5% and *10%. 

As presented in Table 4, the obtained regression results of corrected models revealed 
acceptable goodness of fit for the models based on significant F-test, with 35% and 15% 
of the variations in the dependent variables for Model (1) and Model (2), respectively, 
were explained by the independent variable. Nonetheless, the obtained regression results 
of Model (1) and Model (2) provided evidences that the relationships between financial 
leverage and ROA and MBV among industrial firms in Jordan was significantly negative at 
1% level and 10% level, respectively. In other words, higher financial leverage reduces 
ROA (accounting-based measure) and MBV (market-based measure), which is 
corroborated with previous studies on firms in developed countries and developing 
countries (Balakrishnan & Fox, 1993; Frank & Goyal, 2003; Tzelepis & Skuras, 2004; 
Zeitun & Tian, 2007). Consistent with Raza, Aslam, & Farooq (2013), firms in developing 
countries tend to overleverage themselves, which contribute negative performance.  

Competitive strategy (cost leadership and product differentiation) as the moderator (STR) 
was considered as the dummy variable in the regression models of this study. Firms with 
cost leadership strategy were coded as 1 whereas firms with product differentiation 
strategy were coded as 0. The obtained results revealed that STR did influence the effects 
of financial leverage (FLEV) towards firms’ performance in terms of ROA and MBV. 
Moreover, statistically significantly positive coefficient of FLEVSTR was revealed. The 
relationship between FLEV and performance of firms was linear. Meanwhile, the sum of 
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coefficients on FLEVSTR and FLEV indicated the relationship for cost leadership while 
the coefficient on FLEV indicated the relationship for product differentiation. As shown 
in Model (1), the relationship between FLEV and ROA was significantly influenced by 
STR at 5% level. Based on the coefficient, it was found that the negative effects of FLEV 
were more significant for the case of product differentiation compared to the case of cost 
leadership, which supported the first hypothesis in this study. On the other hand, referring 
to Model (2), STR was revealed to influence the relationship between FLEV and MBV at 
1% level. Based on the coefficient, the negative effects of FLEV were more significant for 
the case of cost leadership than for the case of product differentiation, which rejected the 
second hypothesis in this study. Despite the varied results between Model (1) and Model 
(2), this study proved that the effects of financial leverage towards firms’ performance 
were moderated by competitive strategy. The results of both regression models could be 
due to the significantly positive relationship between the quality orientation and 
performance of firms (Kanagasabai, 2008; Slater & Narver, 1996), which subsequently 
influence the relationship between financial leverage and performance of firms through 
cost leadership strategy in both models. These results somehow explained the 
inconsistencies found in previous studies on the effects of financial leverage towards the 
firms’ performance.  

As for the control variables, firm size was revealed to have significantly positive 
relationship with ROA in Model (1) only, which is shown in Table 4. There was 
insignificant relationship between firm size and MBV in Model (2). Adding to that, there 
were insignificant relationships between the remaining control variables with ROA and 
MBV, respectively.  

5. Conclusion 

This study primarily aimed to examine the moderating effects of competitive strategy on 
the relationship between financial leverage and performance of selected industrial firms in 
Jordan. Compared to its neighboring countries, such as Iraq, Syria, and Palestine, Jordan is 
politically stable, which enhances the stability of other essential aspects in this country. 
Moreover, firms in Jordan have become essential to the economic development due to the 
economic reform over the past three decades. Besides that, previous studies presented 
inconclusive results on the effects of financial leverage towards the performance of firms. 
Thus, both of these aspects propelled this study to propound hypotheses that competitive 
strategy influence the effects of financial leverage towards the performance of firms. As a 
result, the present study reaffirmed that competitive strategy did moderate the 
relationship, which are consistent with previous studies, such as Jermias (2008) and 
Farooq et al. (2014). In line with Jensen (1986), Simerly & Li (2000), and O’Brien (2003), 
firms that employ cost leadership strategy experience tax advantages and increased 
efficiency through debt financing and/or debt covenants. However, Modigliani & Miller 
(1958) suggested that financial leverage and firms’ performance are not associated, which 
contradicted this study. Nonetheless, this study revealed financial leverage did influence 
the performance of firms despite the moderating effects of competitive strategy. The 
effects of debt towards the performance of firms possibly vary in different contexts, 
which explains the inconsistent results obtained in related studies.  

Both ROA (accounting-based measure) and MBV (market-based measure) were measured 
to examine the robustness of the obtained results in this study. Results demonstrated that 
there was significant relationship between financial leverage and performance of firms, 
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which was moderated by competitive strategy. However, the moderating effects presented 
in each regression model varied. Consistent with Farooq et al. (2014), Model (1) in this 
study revealed that the negative effects of financial leverage towards performance of firms 
(ROA) were more significant for firms that employ product differentiation strategy; which 
supported the first hypothesis. Conversely, Model (2) in this study demonstrated the 
negative effects of financial leverage towards performance of firms (MBV) were more 
significant for firms that employ cost leadership strategy; which rejected the second 
hypothesis and inconsistent with the results presented by Jermias (2008). This could be 
due to the difference between the sample used in this study (sample from developing 
country) and the sample used by Jermias (2008) (sample from developed country). The 
latter sample vary from the former sample in numerous characteristics, such as corporate 
capital structure, corporate governance, financial system in emerging markets (which is 
commonly more bank-based than in developed countries), liquidation law, ownership 
structure, political system, and taxation system. Despite similar measurements applied in 
both studies, different samples eventually produce different results. 

Accordingly, this improves the overall understanding on the effects of financial leverage 
towards the performance of firms as well as how this relationship is moderated by the 
type of competitive strategy employed by firms in an emerging market such as Jordan. 
This study serves significant implications to the policymakers and business sector, 
specifically in Jordan. In addition, this study contributed significant results as inputs to 
assist relevant authorities or regulatory bodies, including ASE and Central Bank of Jordan, 
in their efforts of planning and designing appropriate policies for business operations in 
Jordan. Moreover, the current overview of the business sector and their contributions to 
economic growth can be evaluated by these authorities. 
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