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The Parathion Ban: A Mod­
ern-Day Parable of the 
Blind Men and the Elephant 
Comment 
• Studies that estimate the economic 
impacts of banning pesticides generate 
considerable public policy interest. Al­
though some research predicts large eco­
nomic losses, other ex post studies claim 
no severe economic effects and that the 
large negative predictions are based 
upon subjective, untrustworthy analy­
sis. A recent example of this ex post 
analysis is the article by Moore and 
Villarejo in Choices Third Quarter 1996 
("Pesticide Cancellations and Kentucky 
Windage"). The authors take to task 
the analysts who predicted serious eco­
nomic impacts if EPA were to ban the 
use of the insecticide parathion for Cali­
fornia lettuce (up to a 25% yield loss). 

Moore and Villarejo studied the let­
tuce production data from six large pro­
duce growers in California and com­
pared yields in the period before can­
cellation with yields after cancellation 
and found no difference in lettuce yields 
with and without parathion. They con­
clude that the original studies were bi­
ased toward a worst-case scenario. Al­
though they claim to describe what re­
ally happened following the parathion 
ban, Moore and Villarejo simply ob­
serve that lettuce yields did not decline 
following the ban on parathion. Their 
only conclusion suggests that the origi­
nal studies were wrong. However, a 
closer examination of what really hap­
pened following the ban on parathion 
indicates that most of what was pre­
dicted actually happened and that nega­
tive yield effects were mitigated by ser­
endipitous events. 

The original economic impact stud­
ies authored by Lichtenberg et al. and 

USDA predicted that if parathion were 
to be banned for California lettuce, 
growers would substitute an alternative 
insecticide, diazinon. In fact, that is 
what happened. Figure 1 displays par­
athion and diazinon usage data for Cali­
fornia lettuce acreage 1984-92. The 
steep decline in parathion usage is 
matched by the significant increase in 
diazinon usage. While Moore and 
Villarejo's article included a chart de­
picting parathion's decline, they did not 
even mention the sharp increase in 
diazinon usage as a replacement. The 
sharp rise in diazinon usage confirms 
the original studies' substitution pre­
diction. The original studies all pre­
dicted that insecticide costs for lettuce 
growers would rise following the par­
athion ban since diazinon is more ex­
pensive. Moore and Villarejo did not 
report any analysis of the insecticide 
purchases of their grower sample. A 
comparison of the University of 
California's "Sample Costs to Produce 
Lettuce in Monterey County" for 1986 
and 1992 indicates a $51 per acre tn-
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Letters 

crease occurred in the cost of pest con­
trol materials. 

The original economic impact stud­
ies predicted reduced yields would re­
sult if growers switched to the more 
expensive, but less effective, diazinon. 
Why didn' t lettuce yields decline? Ser­
endipitous events occurred in two dif­
ferent lettuce growing regions and pre­
vented significant yield losses follow­
ing the parathion ban. First, a signifi­
cant decline occurred in cotton acreage 
in southern California (from 100,000 
acres in the early 1980s to 30,000 acres 
by 1990). As cotton is harvested, mas­
sive hordes of insects typically move 
into adjacent crops such as lettuce. 
With the decline in cotton acreage (at 
roughly the same time as the ban on 
parathion), significantly less insect pres­
sure occurred in lettuce fields and yield 
losses did not occur. 

A second (not entirely serendipitous) 
event was the removal of all Lombardy 
Poplar trees within a mile of lettuce 
fields in the Salinas Valley. Moore and 
Villarejo correctly identify the lettuce 
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root aphid as a major target of par­
athion sprays in lettuce. Lettuce root 
aphids spend the winter on the bark of 
Lombardy Poplar trees. They migrate 
to lettuce in the spring and begin to 

feed and reproduce. Heavy aphid popu­
lations can cause collapse and death of 
lettuce plants. Following the ban on 
parathion, lettuce growers were left 
without a single material that could be 
used once an infestation was estab­
lished. As a result of removing all the 
Lombardy Poplar trees, the overwin­
tering habitat was destroyed and sig­
nificantly less insect pressure occurred 
in lettuce fields. The original economic 
impact analyses noted the importance 
of Lombardy Poplars as an overwinter­
ing site for lettuce root aphid, did not 
envision the removal of the trees, and 
assumed that the growers would use 
the less effective material and incur 
yield losses. 

Moore and Villarejo fault the eco­
nomic models for failing to take into 
account the full set of costs and ben­
efits that would accrue to society fol­
lowing a pesticide ban. Their complaint 
is that the models ignore the gains of 
reduced illnesses to farm workers and 
only calculate the potential loss in let­
tuce yields. However, Moore and 
Villarejo commit the same error in that 
they do not calculate the risk and envi­
ronmental tradeoffs of substituting 
diazinon and tree removal for parathion 
usage. While parathion use resulted in 
greater risk to farm workers, diazinon 
use poses its own risks as well. EPA 
canceled diazinon usage for golf courses 
and sod farms because of bird die-offs. 
Did society really incur an overall net 
benefit following the parathion ban? 
Moore and Villarejo cannot respond 
with a positive answer because they fail 
to estimate the magnitude of the risk­
risk and risk-environmental tradeoffs. 
A comprehensive study would consider 
both the tradeoffs between health and 
safety risks to field workers from par­
athion and (1) risks of bird kills from 
diazinon; (2) risks to workers using 
chainsaws to cut down the poplar trees; 
(3) risks to workers and the environ­
ment from using chemical herbicides 
to kill the poplar tree roots; and (4) 

the loss of scenic amenities from cutting 
down poplar trees. Thus, the Moore and 
Villarejo analysis suffers from the same 
lack of thoroughness for which they criti­
cize the original studies. I 

Moore and Villarejo make a very 
valid point that there should be con­
siderably more research to develop so­
phisticated models for individual crops 
so that the true behavior of dynamic 
industries could be identified and mod­
eled following a predicted change in 
pesticide registrations. The available 
economic models for most fruit and 
vegetable crops are simplistic. However, 
the authors should realize the enormity 
of their recommendation. There are 
80-100 significant fruit and vegetable 
crops for which sophisticated economic 
models need to be developed. Such 

models would be very complicated and 
would have to be maintained over time 
to stay current. Additional models re­
garding the efficacy of pesticides and 
the infestations and potential losses 
from uncontrolled pests (weeds, dis­
eases, insects) would have to be devel­
oped for all significant growing regions 
in the country. A conservative cost es­
timate for this model and data devel­
opment is approximately $100 million 
over ten years. 

Until society spends the necessary 
resources to develop economic and pest 
models for fruit and vegetable crops, 
regulatory agencies such as EPA will still 
need to rely on Kentucky Windage (the 
advice of experts) to predict economic 
effects of particular pesticide bans. Crit­
ics need to understand what the experts 
are saying with their predictions of po­
tential yield losses: "this is an important 
chemical, and some negative effects can 
be foreseen." It may not be a yield loss 
as predicted. However, those are the 
terms of the questions posed to experts. 
Perhaps the questions need to be more 

sophisticated-but there is a research 
cost in the development of better ques­
tions as well. 

Moore and Villarejo discount con­
tacting the experts for their opinions 
and rely instead on a statistical analysis 
to conclude that there were no nega­
tive effects following the parathion ban 
for lettuce. In actuality, there is no sub­
stitution at this time for the opinions 
and predictions of Cooperative Exten­
sion specialists in the field. Moore and 
Villarejo should have at least contacted 
the experts for explanations of what re­
ally happened. Without the help of Ex­
tension Service specialists in trying to 
understand the realities of crop protec­
tion techniques, society would be like 
blind men, each touching just a part of 
an elephant, and each claiming to un­
derstand the whole. 

Leonard P. Gianessi 
National Center for Food and 

Agricultural Policy 

The Parathion Ban 
Authors' Response 
• We regret our failure to make clear 
the critical elements of our Kentucky 
Windage article, (Choices Third Quar­
ter 1996). First, our mission was to 
challenge Lichtenberg et al.' s 1987 as­
sertion that cancellation of the pesti­
cide ethyl parathion for control of the 
lettuce root aphid would have a major 
impact on both producers and consum­
ers (E. Lichtenberg, D. Parker, and D. 
Zilberman, Economic Impacts of Can­
celing Parathion Registration fo r Let­
tuce, Western Consortium for the 
Health Professions, Inc., San Fran­
cisco, 1987). Lichtenberg et al. state 
in their executive summary: "There 
are presently no alternative chemicals 
(to parathion) available for control of 
lettuce root aphid .... Left untreated, 
a typical infestation would reduce 
yields by as much as 20-30 percent; 
the impact of canceling parathion on 
growers affected by lettuce root aphid 
infestations would therefore be yield 
reductions on the order of 25 per­
cent. " Second, the geographical fo­
cus of our article was the Central 
Coast of California, the only produc­
tion area where lettuce root aphid in-



festations were sufficiently serious to 
be a cause for concern. 

Gianessi takes us to task for failing 
to give credit to the substicution of the 
chemical diazinon for the more effec­
tive ethyl parathion. He expresses con­
cern that our statistical results showing 
no difference between lettuce yields be­
fore and after cancellation of ethyl par­
athion was somehow due to the shift 
to diazinon. This is contrary to 

Lichtenberg et al.'s statement above say­
i ng there are no chemical substi cutes 
fo r parathion on the lettuce root aphid. 
He is correct, however, in pointing out 
our failure to assess the socio/economic 
impact of this substicution. We should 
have pointed out that reported cases of 
acute agricul tural worker illnesses due 
to exposure to diazinon in the period 
1984-89 numbered 28, compared to 
117 for parathion for the same period 
(W.S. Pease, R.A. Morello-Frosch, D.S. 
Albright, A.D. Kyle , and J.C . 
Robinson, Preventing Pesticide-related 
ILLness in CaLifornia AgricuLture, Cali­
fornia Policy Seminar, University of 
California, 1993). Clearly diazinon is a 
far safer pesticide than parathion the 
pes ticide now banned due to persis­
tently high injury rates. Also he notes 
producer costs h~ve increased due to 
the substi cution; however, G ianessi 
should have deflated h is cost increase 
using tlle index of Prices Paid by Farm­
ers for chemicals between 1986 and 
1992. This price index increased from 
89 to 103 during the period and soft­
ens the blow a bit in real terms. 

Gianessi suggests that serendipity is 
the roOt cause of our inability to find a 
statistically significant change in lettuce 
yields. Serendipity is an odd term to 
use in scien tific investigations. Maybe 
"incomplete analysis in the original 
Lichtenberg et al. scudy" would be a 
more accurate descriptor. Nevertheless, 
Gianessi raises two interesting points. 
First, he describes the major decrease 
in cotton acreage in southern Califor­
nia (located in tlle inland deserts of 
Imperial County adjacent to the Mexi­
can Border) as contributing to the lack 
of letcuce yield losses. A cotton insect 
anack on the Sali nas Valley letcuce 
crop, located along the Central Coast, 

would requ ire those Imperial Valley 
cotton insects to cross a rather large 
desert and fly over twO moun tai n 
ranges, a total of 500 miles, to reach 
Steinbeck's "East of Eden." 

Second, Gianessi , without documen­
tation (more Kentucky Windage?) , fur­
ther suggests that the act of removing 
the Lombardy poplar trees in the Sali­
nas Valley also contributed to our find­
ing of no yield loss due to cancellation. 
He then faul ts us for not showing the 
societal loss from removing these trees. 
On a recent drive through the Salinas 
Valley, we noted the loss of the pop­
lars. However, the poplars had been re­
placed by acres of wine grapes whose 
rich red foliage was aesthetically much 
more pleasing, and the varietal wines 

produced from these vines have become 
the envy of many European vintners. 
A loss? We think not. 

Gianessi 's support for the develop­
ment of more comprehensive economic 
models for pesticide reregistration 
analysis is praiseworthy. Al though he 
laments the high COSt of such a model 
and data base, $100 million over ten 
years, we would point out the fo llow­
ing: Lichtenberg et al. estimated the 
net loss in producer's surplus due to 
cancellation of parathion, attributed 
dan1age primarily caused by the lenuce 
root aphid, at $24 million per year and 
the loss in consumer surplus at $48 
mill ion per yea r. Simp le arith metic 
shows the payback period for such an 
investment would be only 1.39 years. 

Finally, Gianessi offers his critique 
as a "parable"; we would offer our own, 
as fo llows: 

"On the Political Economy of 
. Pesticide Cancellation" 
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Cast of characters 
1. Chicken Litde 
2. Henny Penny-co nsultant 
3. Duckey Luckey-con ultant 
4. Chicken Licken-close fri end and 

consultant 
5. Wi lbur-"some pig"-understands 

farm worker illness and environ­
mental damage caused by pesticides 

6. Farmer McGregor-grows lenuce 
and supporrs Chicken Little's 
hypothesis 

7. Br'er Rabbit-an ardent letcuce 
consumer 

8. The King-has the power to prevent 
sky from fall ing 

9. Little Boy who cried "Wolf'­
lobbyist 

Story Line 
Once upon a time, Chicken Linle, 

while walking through the letcuce 
patch, was hit on the head by a small 
unidentified object. Chicken Littl e 
raced through the barn yard crying, 
"The sky is falling! The sky is falling! " 
Farmer McGregor upon hearing these 
cries became so concerned that he con­
cluded not only should the King be 
informed that the sky was falling but 
the Ki ng should also do somethi ng 
about it. Farmer McGregor hired the 
consulting firm of Penny, Luckey, and 
Licken, who are all fri ends of Chicken 
Litde, to estimate the potential dam­
ages to his letcuce patch if the sky fell. 

Each economic consultant developed 
her own model beca use eco nomists 
can't agree on much of anything. 
Henny Pen ny choose a partial budget 
model because she knew that, based on 
the armchair guesstimates of her "ex­
perts," the greatest damage to Farmer 
McGregor could be demonstrated if no 
adjustments in production or con ump­
tion were allowed. Duckey Luckey 
choose an economic model that al lowed 
the peo ple who bought Farmer 
McGregor's lettuce to adjust to higher 
letcuce prices, but Farmer McG regor 
could not change the amount of let­
cuce he grew even though Br'er Rabbit 
would pay him more to grow it. 
Chicken Licken chose an economic 
model that al lowed for adjustments in 
production and consumption but took 
Farmer McGregor's word that his ler-
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tuce yields would decrease 25% if the 
King didn't save him. The sky was not 
only going to fall, it was going to land 
right on Farmer McGregor's lettuce 
patch. Farmer McGregor then hired a 
Little Boy from the village who had 
experience in crying "Wolf" on several 
other occasions to warn the villagers 
and the King that the sky was falling. 

Unbeknownst to Chicken Little et 
al. , Wilbur, "some pig," a keen observer 
of the sky, took a wait-and-see attitude 
while also closely watching Farmer 
McGregor's lettuce patch. By careful 
observation and measurement he found 
that the object that had landed on 
Chicken Little's head was not the sky 
falling but rather an acorn from an oak 
tree. Wilbur also found that Farmer 
McGregor grew the same number of 
heads of lettuce after the acorns fell as 
he had before. Wilbur, speaking for 
those who worked in Farmer 
McGregor's lettuce patch also pointed 
out to the King that he should include 
in his sky management decisions the 
illnesses the workers incurred in the let­
tuce patch as well as the loss of the 
flowers and birds that have no say in 
what is to be done about the sky. Fi­
nally, Wilbur found there were many 
kinds of acorns in the forest, Parathion 
acorns, Methyl Bromide acorns, 
MeviPnphos acorns, etc. Each time one 
of the acorns fell , Farmer McGregor 
hired the Little Boy who cried "Wolf" 
so well to carry the message to the King. 
However, after a time, no one paid him 
any attention because, in fact, the sky 
did not fall. 
Charles V. Moore and Don Villarejo 

Canadian Wheat Board 
A Comment 
• It was interesting to read yet an­
other version of the claimed high level 
of market performance of the Cana­
dian Wheat Board (CWB) in Choices. 
Some of us who have researched and 
written on Canadian grain marketing 
welcome economic exposure after sixty 
years of marketing regulation. There 
have been at least seven major pieces 
of economic analysis released on the 
operation of the CWB since 1992. This 
work is seen to fal l into two camps: 

one which is paid for by the CWB and 
is claimed to be based on CWB "open 
book" but confidential data; and one 
which has no direct interest affiliation 
and depends on secondary but verifi­
able data. 

The first study was conducted in 
1992 by the CWE on its barley sales 
into the United States; that piece pro­
vided a very favorable assessment of 
market performance. Carter (UC Davis) 
conducted a study of the continental 
barley market in 1993 for the Cana­
dian federal minister of agriculture and 
an industry panel consisting of over 
twenty members. Carter recommended 
that single desk selling (SDS) of barley 
to the U.S. should be replaced with a 
dual marketing system. Johnson and 

* * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * * 

Wilson (NDSU) produced evidence in 
1994, and Clark (Nova Scotia Agricul­
tural College) in 1995, that was gener­
ally consistent with Carter's conclusions. 
The CWB has repeatedly criticized 
Carter's study for its use of poor data. 

The 1996 Kraft, Furtan, and 
Tyrchniewicz report was commissioned 
by the CWE. It was the first of the se­
lected "open book" (in terms of data) 
studies and claimed significant benefits 
at the port level from SDS of ordinary 
wheat. Carter and Loyns reported to 
the Alberta Government in 1996 that 
there are . significant costs associated 
with SDS (larger than any of the CWB 
reported benefits) and that there was 
no evidence of farmer returns under 

SDS exceeding those avai lable to U.S. 
producers. Rutter (a policy analyst for 
United Grain Growers Ltd.), in a 1996 
submission to a Canadian Panel study­
ing grain marketing and updated later 
in a (University of Manitoba) M.Sc. 
research paper, found no consistent evi­
dence indicating Canadian farmers beat 
their U.S . counterparts in returns for 
CWB-controlled wheat and barley. 
Two 1997 reports, Schmitz, Gray, 
Schmitz, and Storey on barley, and 
Kraft on soft wheat, both commissioned 
by the CWE, found benefits from SDS. 

This level of economist interest in 
the performance of a government 
agency is unprecedented. There had 
never been a public performance re­
view undertaken in the sixty-year his­
tory of the Board, and serious inde­
pendent economic analysis has been 
limited because the fundamental data 
are not available. Goodwin and Smith 
(1995 NAWG report) , Loyns and 
Carter (1984 Economic Council of 
Canada report), Carter (1993 Conti­
nental Barley Market report) and other 
economists have been criticized, mainly 
by the CWB, for their misuse of infor­
mation and wrong conclusions because 
of data deficiencies. 

The results of the CWB studies that 
used "full information" also deserve 
some comments: 

(1) The only evidence of overall posi­
tive performance or significant benefits 
from SDS has come from CWB studies. 

(2) The data for the three recent 
CWB studies are confidential, un­
available to other analysts, and un­
likely ever to be available for inde­
pendent analysis. The results of these 
studies are neither verifiable nor rep­
licable, and there is no indication that 
these studies were subjected to peer 
review. (3) The three studies com­
missioned by the CWB have ad­
dressed only returns at the port level; 
they say nothing except by assump­
tion about farmer returns. The CWB 
and the authors of the Choices article 
insist that the impact of SDS cannot 
be measured at the form Level. 

(4) The CWB studies claim that SDS 
reduces, not increases, marketing costs. 

(5) Two of the Choices authors in 



reporrs to the u.S./Canada Joint Grain 
Commission in 1995 reported that (z) 
Saskatchewan producer prices are not 
different than cross-border Norrh Da­
kota prices (Furtan), and (iz) only 
farmer returns are relevant in this de­
bate (Gray and Gardner). 

(6) The CWB studies do not recog­
nize that regulatory effects on individual 
farmers may be different from measured 
aggregate effects. 

It has been our conclusion, and that 
of several colleagues, that the studies 
paid for by the CWB do not meet the 
basic criteria of scientific objectivity. 
The claim by the agency and these 
economists that effects on producer re­
turns cannot be measured is unconvinc­
ing: (1) the agency claims that its man­
date is to maximize farmer returns but 
it also claims that achievement of that 
objective cannot be directly measured; 
(2) members of a profession that is dis­
tinguished by its interest in, and ability 
to measure, economic impacts say that 
SDS effects cannot be evaluated at the 
farm level. The distributional effects of 
CWB pooling and marketing quotas has 
been substantial. In any event, these 
CWB studies have not produced evi­
dence on whether prairie farmers are bet­
ter or worse off with SDS. They have 
not analyzed SDS ·costs. 

That these issues are being raised 
outside the extremely narrow confines 
of the Canadian profession is com­
mendable. Clearly there is much more 
to be done and said. In this regard, there 
will be rwo sessions on grain marketing 
and the CWB at the joint CAEFMS/ 
AAEA meeting in Toronto this July. In­
terested members should attend. 

There are a couple of curious iro­
nies associated with the Schmitz et al. 
article appearing in an economics pub­
lication called Choices. Choice in grain 
marketing is the most important issue 
facing Canadian prairie farmers today. 
It is also the most important agricul­
tural policy issue on the prairies. It is 
the issue which resulted in all of these 
economic studies. If farmers on the Ca­
nadian prairies had normal choice in 
marketing their wheat and barley, this 
issue and the studies would virtually 
disappear. The second irony is the pho-

tograph in the article of a mega-horse 
barn in southern Saskatchewan; horses 
and horse barns have nothing to do 
with grain marketing today except their 
symbolism in relation to the agency be­
ing evaluated. 

Colin A. Carter 
University of California, Davis 

R.M.A. Loyns 
University of California, Davis, and 

University of Manitoba 

The Canadian Wheat Board 
Authors respond 
• The main points raised by Carter 
and Loyns in their letter to the editor 
were that the studies favorable to the 
CWB (1) were funded by the CWB; 
(2) were unscientific in nature; (3) used 
confidential data; and (4) did not deal 
with real issues, such as the impact on 
farmgate prices, and farmers ' choices 
in grain marketing. 

Carter and Loyns's alleged correla­
tion berween funding and results is in­
correct. First, the studies by Carter (Im­
proving Agricultural Trade Performance 
under the GATT, 1992), Schmitz et al. 
(A Continental Barley Market: Where 
Are the Gains? 1993) and Gardner and 
Gray ("The Impact of Canadian and 
U.S. Farm Policies on Grain Produc­
tion and Trade," 1995) were not funded 
by the Canadian Wheat Board (CWB). 
They used secondary data and reported 
positive benefits to single-desk selling 
(SDS). Second, the study by Johnson 
and Wilson (North American Barley 
Trade Competition, 1994) did not even 
model SDS behavior. 

Carter and Loyns's conclusion, that 
the studies funded by the CWB did 
not meet the basic criteria of scientific 
objectivity, seems to rest on the fact 
that the CWB sales data were confi­
dential and prevented works from these 
reporrs to be published in refereed eco­
nomic journals. From the perspective of 
scientific replication, we agree it is un­
fortunate that the type of data provided 
by the CWB is not more publicly avail­
able, because secondary data are often 
inadequate to examine market perfor­
mance. However, whether or not the 
use of confidential data makes a study 
Unscientific is open to question. Also, 

CHOICES Second Quarter 1997 41 

whether or not the data will be open to 
the public has not yet been resolved. 

Carter and Loyns's comments reflect 
a fundamental disagreement on method­
ology. They seem to be saying that U.S. 
farm gate prices are higher than in Canada 
and that this can be attributed to SDS. 
For example, the United States has oper­
ated EEP for most of the past decade. 
This policy difference berween the United 
States and Canada significantly affects 
relative producer prices making it unrea­
sonable to attribute observed differences 
in farmgate prices solely to SDS (figure 
2.6, Schmitz et al., 1997) . 

Kraft et al. (Performance Evaluation 
of the Canadian Wheat Board, 1996) 
and Schmitz et al. (1997) employed a 
different methodology to determine 
impacts on farm prices. Kraft et al. 
compared the basis levels between 
farmgate prices and port-position prices. 
They found that non-CWB grains had 
higher marketing COStS than those grains 
marketed by the CWB. Schmitz et al. 
(1997) did extensive analyses and re­
viewed several studies including Carter 
and Loyns. They found no convincing 
evidence that current marketing costs 
were higher than those that would ex­
ist in the absence of SDS. Because there 
was no clear evidence that marketing 
costs would decrease in the absence of 
SDS, both studies concluded that 
changes in the port-position price 
would be fully reflected by changes in 
the farmgate price, hence, the focus on 
port-position price changes. 

Carter and Loyns's comments on the 
"full information" studies contain some 
important factual errors and reflect 
some misinterpretations. As examples: 
• They claim that the only evidence of 

overall positive benefits came from 
CWB-funded studies. This statement 
is false as discussed above. 

• They suggest that the CWB sales data 
will never be available for indepen­
dent analysis. This is an empirical 
question for which only time will 
tell. Schmitz et al. have asked the 
CWB to mak~ the data available for 
further analysis. 

• Papers from the studies funded by the 
CWB have been submitted to peer re­
view. T he standard of peer review ap-
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plies to aiL of the studies, not just those 
funded by the CWB. We are awai ting 
the results, juSt as we are waiting for 
the results from the twO major reports, 
both consul tative in nature, by Carrel' 
and by Carter and Loyns that are 
highly critical of the CWB. 

• They assert that no calculations of 
farmer returns were made. This is not 
so! As stated earlier, Schmitz et al.'s 
(1997) co nclusions on farm returns 
were based on economic analysis. 
Also, in Choices there is no claim that 
the impact of SDS cannot be calcu­
lated at the farm level. 

• They com end that some of the au­
thors' previous work is at odds with 
recem study resul ts. G iven policy 
differences, Furtan ' s s tate ment, 
which sugges ted that for some pe­
riod of time the Canadian and U.S. 
prices were equal, is not co ntradic­
tory to a premium derived from 

DS. T he statement by Gardner and 
G ray m erely espo uses their view of 
the importance of examining policy 
impacts at the farmgate. 
Our critics raise an interes ting point 

about "choices." In February 1997, all 
producers in western Canada who grew 
barley in the last five years were asked 
to vote on the continued existence of 
CWB malti ng barley. Over 62 percent 
of barley producers voted in favo r of 
retaining SDS. Also, the Alberta Barley 
Commission and others argued in the 
Federal Court of Canada that the CWB 
Act violated provisions of the Canadian 
Charter of Rights and Freedoms. In de­
livering his recent decision in favor of 
the CWB (Apri l 1997) the Honorable 
Justice Muldoon offered clarity on the 
co nstituti onali ty of th e CWB: "In 
Canada's free and democratic society, 
Parliament, with its undoubted power 
to make laws within the class of subject 
of trade and commerce, must remain 
free to fix what is quintessentially a po­
litical problem." CWB is an issue for 
public policy, not for courts. 

Carter and Loyns conrend that the 
"mega-horse barn" from the Choices ar­
ticle is as obsolete today as is the CWB. 
Ironically, the barn is not a horse barn; 
it is a dairy barn . Perhaps having .to 
rely on the imperfect lens of secondalY 

data has also impaired their view of the 
performance of the CWB. 

Andrew Schmitz, Hartley Furtan , 
Harvey Brooks, and Richard Gray 

The Hidden DimenSIon of 
Markets in Transition 
• With great interest I read two re­
cent articles in Choices which focused 
on the economies of Russia (Goodwin 
et al ., Third Quarter 1996) and Bul­
garia (Mouton and Schmitz, Fourth 
Quarter 1996). Both articles detailed 
the current fa ilures and provided pre­
scriptions for a smooth transition from 
a command to a market eco nomy. 
T hese articles are thorough from an 
economic perspective bur both overlook 
an addition al dimension wh ich is 
subtle, complex, and not easi ly respon­
sive to the too ls of economists. 

The history and culture of these so­
cieties retards the movement to an open 
market economy. Expecting these soci­
eties to accept new and unbridled mar­
ket mechanisms devoid of state com­
mands is wishful thinking in the shorr 
run for the present generation of citi­
zens. The "invisible hand" of Adam 
Smith to a Russian or a Bulgarian prob­
ably conjures an image of the notori­
ous secret police and now the Mafia. 

Reluctantly, and only with trust, will 
these societies allow impersonal mar­
ket forces and their agents to replace 
the command regimes and their 
apparatchiks. Understanding the culture 
and mindset of Russians and Bulgar­
ians will certainly assist in how to best 
transfer technical assistance to agricul­
tural producers and entrepreneurs and 
implement needed policy changes. The 
free flow of information and resources 
and the removal of institutional rigidi­
ti es will allow for an environment 
whereby an entrepreneurial class is cre­
ated that understands and appreciates 
the economic prescription mentioned 
in both articles. Society's acceptance of 
a market economy and its entrepreneurs 
will come when their perceived ben­
efits outweigh the realized high social 
cos ts of a co mmand economy. A new 
market culture will then be established. 

Gregory M. Sullivan 
Delta, Colorado 

Environmentally Sustaining 
Agriculture 
Debate continues 
• T he Hitzhusen/Davis response to 
my article ("Environmentally Sustain­
ing Agriculture," First Quarter 1997) 
usefully highlighted the key elements 
of the deba te on preserving the world's 
biodiversity. 

Hitzhusen and Davis correctly note 
tllat my "solution" depends on world 
population growth ending relatively 
soon. Fortunately, even anti-population 
activists are now ci ting Seekler and Cox's 
projection (for W inrock) of a peak world 
population of 8.5 billion in 2035 . 

Hithusen and Davis are also correct 
tllat the big challenge for the food sys­
tem only appears if the world contin­
ues to rapidly get richer. However, the 
global trend toward trade-led economic 
growth is becom ing clearer by the day. 
Five billion people are rapidly becom­
ing part of it! 

I am puzzled, however , at the 
H itzhusen/Davis sugges tio n that it 
would be "poor public policy" to try 
saving the world's biodiversity by rais­
ing yields on the existing farmland be­
cause there are sizeable number of other 
factors needed to preserve al l of the 
biodiversi ty. 

Obviously there are. Bur can any glo­
bal effort to save the biodiversity not start 
with preventing the plow-down of wild­
lands for low-yield crops and pasture? The 
potential loss of wildlands would be equal 
~o the total land area of North America, 
South America, and Mrica! 

It would seem environmentally irre­
sponsible not to count on most of the 
world being affluent by 2040, and not 
to be prepared to deal with the envi ­
ronmental consequences if they are. Es­
pecially since agricultural research is 
relatively cheap and also offers substan­
tial benefi ts to the wo rld's poor. 

Dennis Avery, Director 
Center for Global Food Issues, 

Hudson Institute 
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